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LICHFL Apprenticeship Program-003- Advertisement Notification 

Corrigendum – 001 dated 02.07.2025 regarding LICHFL Apprenticeship Program-003 
 
This has reference to our advertisement for Apprenticeship Program-003. Detailed advertisement 
notification was published on LICHFL’s website on 13.06.2025. 
 
Please make note of the following modifications: 
 

Table D: Steps to apply & Important dates 

Steps Particular Date 
window 

Remarks Status 

1 Applications for 
apprenticeship will be invited 
during -> 

13-June-
2025 to 28-
June-2025 

Check selection Procedure – 
point b & c 

No 
Change 

2 Last Date to pay the 
examination fee to BFSI Sector 
Skill Council of India 

30-June-
2025 

All candidates who complete 
Step 1 and if found eligible 
will receive communication 
from BFSI Sector Skill Council 
of India about the 
examination pattern and 
bank details to make payment 
of the examination fee. 

No 
Change 

3 Entrance Examination will be 
conducted by BFSI Sector Skill 
Council of India 

05-July-
2025 

 Change 

4 Candidates shortlisted based 
on the entrance examination 
result will be invited for 
Document Verification & 
Personal Interview at LIC HFL 
offices 

10-July-
2025 to 11-
July-2025 
(tentative) 

 Change 

5 Final selected candidates will 
be issued offer letters by LIC 
HFL stating their 
Apprenticeship Training 
Branch, Monthly Stipend 
Payable, Rules / Regulations / 
Terms & Conditions related to 
the apprenticeship program 
of LIC HFL. 

14-July-
2025 to 15-
July-2025 
(tentative) 

 Change 

6 Candidates who accept the 
offer letters will be asked to 
report to the respective LIC 
HFL branch for their 
apprenticeship training 
program (refer Table A for 
date).  

16-July-
2025 
(tentative) 

 Change 

 


